OavVi0T0D “ALNHOVIVd
A0 NAMOL THL A0 TIDONNOD NMOL

1202 FOT
jo Aep "\ oy uo i1okey 9yl Aq poaordde pue [Z0T (VYT
7o Kep T\ oY) UO ‘OpeIo]o) ‘AInyorIE JO UMO], Y} Ul [[EH UMO], & P[ay Sunaaw .113]1‘139.'[ e
OPEIO[O)) “AINYIBIRJ JO UMO, AU} JO [I0UN0D) UMO, Y} JO ~7) 017 Jo 20A B A9 ATINO A'TLIL

A9 IHSITINd ATAACAO ANV ‘AALIOAV ‘dASSVd ‘AVII ‘ddDNAOULNI

*012191 payorNe Y MQIYXJ] Ul Yy)Ioj 1as se
pajoruaal pue Ajornjud st ul pajeadar £qaiay stapo)) [ediotuniy anydeied 3yl Jo g1 APLL "¢ UONIIS

“1AUNOA) UMO | Y] Aq sSurpuij se pajelodioour aIe s[e310al Su103210) Y], T UONID
[10UNOD UMO], 91} AQ SoUIpUl] SB P ! [eH ! )} 9L "1 UONI3§

'LVHL SNIVAYO
‘0aVIOTOD “ALNHOVIVA 0 NMOL FHL JO TIONNOD dHL “HYOJTUTHL ‘MON

bas 12 “10T-91-1€§ "S™UD Ul yuoy

105 saunpadoad ay) 01 uensind umo |, ayl 10J SIpod Suip[ing ay} se ‘uonips $10¢ 9poD Al [euohBILIaU]

ay) pue apo)) Surquini ] [pUONEUIdU] :2p0)) SED [aN,] [BUOLBUINU] $0po)) [BOIUBYDIA [BUOHIRBUINU]

OpOD) [ENUIPISY [BUOHBIIdIU] 9P0D) uip[ing [RUOTRUIIU] dY) JO SUOLIPL] §[(T AU} 2OUIIDJI Aq 1dope

0) 19pI0 Ul 9po)) [edidIUNiA INYDEIR Y} PUIWE 0) SAIISAP [1OUNO7) UMO [, 9} “JOMEYD uMmO ], anyoeled
3Y1 JO [ [-] UONDAS AQq [1DUNOD UMO], dY} UL PISAA Aptoyne ayy o1 juensind ‘SYIUAAHAA

pue ‘suonipd §10g 3y} Jo uondope SpUdUILIOdAI JJeIs PUE “g[(T Ul SIPOD
SuIp[ing [PUONRUIAU] JO SUONIPS pajepdn pasea[al [12UN0Y) SpO)) [EUOHEWIANU] dUf ‘SYTAAHM

pue
‘Um0 A1 10§ $APOS FUIP[ING JO SUONIPS JAI[IE 2dUAIRJAI AQ pardope sey uMo], ay) ‘SYTUAHM

Ly D) ANy
QWO INYorIEd Y} JO AILIOYINE SY} YIIA pUB UONMINSUOT OPRIO[0]) a1 JO XX 1dey) Jopun paziuedio
Airpediorunw ajni-awWoy e st  Umo],, 9} 10 LOINUYDRIE,,) 2nyorIe] JO UMO ] Y ‘SYIHAHM

AAOD TUIA TVYNOLLVNIALNI HHL ANV “HI0D NOLLVAYISNOD
AOWANA TVYNOILLVNUAINI AHL ‘Hd0D ONIATING ONILSIXA TVNOILVNYALNI
THL ‘40D TVLINAAISTA TVNOLLVNYIINI ‘AAOD SV TiNd TVNOLLVNIALNI
THL ‘AA0D ONIFINNTd TYNOLLYNJAINI THL ‘AA0D TVIINVHOIIN TVNOILLVNYILNI
JHL ‘400D ONIATING TVNOILVNJAINI THL OL SINIWANIWY JdNV 40
NOILLJOQY THL ¥0d ONIAIAOUd ANV TAOD TVAIDINAA THL J0 €1 A'LLLL ONIANHIANY
‘OAVIOTOD “ALAHOVIVA A0 NAAOL AHL A0 TIDNAOD NAOL HH.L 40 IDNVNITGIO NV

#

1T07-£6L'ON ADNVNIAUO
ALAHOVIVd 40 NAOL



Town of Parachute, Colorado
Ordinance No.793-2021
Page 2 of 2

/
by e B

Roy B‘fﬁ/lﬁfluné: Mayor (I/

ATTEST:

/—%\l\ \\7({ n\ AL

c Spaenk T/olw Clerk




Town of Parachute, Colorado
Ordinance No.793-2021
Page 3 of 3

PUBLIC NOTICE
Public notice is hereby given that an Ordinance entitled:

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF PARACHUTE,
COLORADO, AMENDING TITLE 13 OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE

was introduced before the Town Council on \nﬁ{z: \"] ,2021; that a copy of said
Ordinance is posted at Town Hall; and that the Ordinance was approved at a regular meeting of
the Town Council held on \ LU \"] , 2021, and approved by the Mayor
on JLond \"1_, 2021,

Copies of the adopted ordinance are available for inspection at the Town Hall, Parachute,
Colorado, and available on the internet at http://www.parachutecolorado.com.

Dated this \ [ day of _BL\\\Q 2021

TOWN OF PARACHUTE

N Yoo

!L—uc"j/ épalenka,/’ ik owh Clerk




EXHIBIT A

Title 13
BUILDINGS AND CONSTRUCTION

Chapter 13.10
GENERAL PROVISIONS

13.10.010 Short title.

This title may be cited for all purposes as the “Town of Parachute Building and Construction Code.”

13.10.020 Applicability of codes.

The building codes adopted by reference in this title shall be applicable within the Town of Parachute,

where:

A. A building or structure is built, this title applies to the design and construction of said building or
structure including plumbing, heating and electrical installation of the building or structure;

B. The whole or part of a building, structure, factory-built unit, manufactured home, or mobile home
is moved, either into or from the Town of Parachute or from one (1) property to another within the Town
of Parachute, this title applies to the building, structure, factory-built unit, manufactured home, or mobile
home or part thereof moved and to any remaining part affected by the change, unless otherwise provided
by law;

C. The whole or part of a building, structure, factory-built unit, manufactured home, or mobile home
is demolished, this title applies to the demolition and to any remaining part affected by the change;

D. A building, structure, factory-built unit, manufactured home, or mobile home is altered, this title
applies to the alteration and all parts of the building, structure, factory-built unit, manufactured home, or
mobile home affected by the change;

E. Repairs are made to a building, structure, factory-built unit, manufactured home, or mobile home,
this title applies to any such repair;



Town of Parachute, Colorado
Ordinance No. 793-2021
Exhibit A

Page 2 of 48

F. The class of occupancy of the building or structure or part thereof is changed, this title applies to
all parts of the building or structure affected by the change.

13.10.030 Exceptions.

Otherwise applicable provisions of this title shall not apply to any mobile home, manufactured home, or
factory-built unit which conforms to the health and safety requirements of the Colorado State Board of
Health, the Colorado State Fire Marshal, the Colorado Division of Housing, and/or the National
Manufactured Housing Construction and Safety Standards Act of 1974.

13.10.040 Severability of code provisions.

If any section, sections, subsection or provision of this title or any code adopted by reference in this title,
as adopted, or the application thereof to any person or circumstance is declared unconstitutional or
otherwise invalid by any competent court, such validity shall not affect the other sections, subsections,
provisions or applications of this title or said code adopted by reference if they can be given effect
without the invalid section, sections, subsection, provision or application.

13.10.050 Prevailing provisions.

Where the requirements or conditions imposed by any provision of a code adopted by reference in this
title, or its appendices, differ from the requirements or conditions imposed by a provision of another law,
ordinance, resolution or order having application in the Town of Parachute, the provision which is more
restrictive shall govern.

13.10.060 Violations — Penalty.

A. Except as may otherwise be provided in this title, any person, firm, or corporation violating any
of the provisions of this title shall be deemed guilty of a Class B municipal offense as provided in PMC
11.01.030, and each such person shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense for each and every day or
portion thereof during which any violation of any of the provisions of this title is committed, continued or
permitted. Said offense shall be deemed to be one of “strict liability.” Only the Town of Parachute, by and



Town of Parachute, Colorado
Ordinance No. 793-2021
Exhibit A

Page 3 of 48

through its Building Official, or his designee, the Town Attorney or the Police Department, shall be
permitted to initiate the filing of a complaint in the Parachute Municipal Court for violation of any of the
provisions of this title and the primary codes adopted by reference herein.

B. In the event any building or structure is or is proposed to be erected, constructed, reconstructed,
altered, remodeled, used, or maintained in violation of this title or any primary code adopted by reference
herein, the Town Attorney, upon request of the Building Official or the Town Manager, in addition to
other remedies provided by law, may institute an appropriate action for injunction, mandamus, or
abatement to prevent, enjoin, abate, or remove such unlawful erection, construction, reconstruction,
alteration, remodeling, maintenance, or use, in any court of competent jurisdiction.

Chapter 13.20
BUILDING CODE
13.20.010. Adoption by reference.

A. Pursuant to the power and authority conferred by the laws of the state of Colorado, there is
adopted, by reference thereto, the International Building Code, 2018 Edition, together with the chapters of
the appendix as set forth below, promulgated by the International Code Council, Inc. (hereinafter “IBC”
or “International Building Code”). The purpose of the IBC is to provide minimum standards to safeguard
life and limb, health, property and the public welfare by regulating and controlling various matters
including, but not limited to, the design, construction, quality of materials, use and occupancy, location
and maintenance of all buildings and structures within the Town.

B. The following chapters of the appendix of the International Building Code, 2018 Edition, are
adopted:

Appendix C: Group U Agricultural Buildings

Appendix E: Supplementary Accessibility Requirements
Appendix G: Flood-Resistant Construction.

Appendix I: Patio Covers.

Appendix J: Grading.

C. The fees assessed pursuant to the International Building Code shall be set by Resolution of the
Town Council.



Town of Parachute, Colorado
Ordinance No. 793-2021
Exhibit A

Page 4 of 48

13.20.020 Amendments.

The International Building Code, 2018 Edition, is amended as follows:

A.

Section 101.1. Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:

These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of the Town of Parachute, Colorado, and
shall be cited as such and will be referred to herein as “this code”

Section 101.4.1. Section 101.4.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

The provisions of the International Fuel gas Code as amended and adopted by the State of
Colorado Plumbing Board (per 3 CCR 720-1 of the Code of Colorado Regulations.)

Section 101.4.3. Section 101.4.3 is amended to read:

The provisions of the International Plumbing Code as amended and adopted by the State of
Colorado Plumbing Board (per 3 CCR 720-1 of the Code of Colorado Regulations).

Section 101.4.4. Section 101.4.4 is hereby repealed in its entirety.
Section 102.6. Section 102.6 is hereby amended to read as follows:

The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date of the adoption of this code shall be
permitted to continue without change, except as is specifically covered in this code, or the
International Fire Code, or as is deemed necessary by the Building Official for the general safety
and welfare of the occupants and the public.

Section 103.3. Section 103.3 is amended to read as follows:

In accordance with the prescribed procedures of this jurisdiction and with the concurrence of the
appointing authority, the Building Official shall have the authority to appoint a deputy Building
Official, the related technical officers, inspectors, plan examiners and other employees. Such
employees shall have powers as delegated by the Building Official.

Section 104.1. Section 104.1 is amended to read as follows:

The Building Official is hereby authorized and directed to enforce all of the provisions of this
code; however, a guarantee that all buildings and structures have been constructed in accordance
with all of the provisions of this code is neither intended nor implied. The Building Official shall
have the authority to render interpretations of this code and to adopt policies and procedures in



Town of Parachute, Colorado
Ordinance No. 793-2021
Exhibit A

Page 5 of 48

order to clarify the applications of its provisions. Such interpretations, policies and procedures
shall be in conformance with the intent and purpose of this code. Such policies and procedures
shall not have the effect of waiving requirements specifically provided for in this code.

H. Section 104.8. Section 104.8 is amended to read as follows:

The adoption of this code, and any previous Codes adopted by the Town of Parachute, shall not
be deemed to give rise to a duty of care on the part of any public entity, public employee or agent,
nor shall this code or any previous Codes be deemed to create any civil remedy against a public
entity, public employee or agent. The Building Official, members of the Board of Adjustments or
employee charged with the enforcement of this code, while acting for the jurisdiction in good
faith and without malice in the discharge of duties required by this code or other law or
ordinance, shall not thereby be rendered liable personally and is hereby relieved from personal
liability for any damage accruing to persons or property as a result of a direct act or by reason of
an act or omission in the discharge of duties. Any suit instituted against an officer or employee
because of an act performed by that officer or employee in the lawful discharge of duties and
under the provisions of this code shall be defended by legal representative of the jurisdiction until
the final termination of the proceedings. The Building Official or any subordinate shall not be
liable for cost in any action, suit or proceeding that is instituted in pursuance of the provisions of

this code.
L Section 105.1.1. Section 105.1.1 is hereby repealed in its entirety.
J. Sections 104.10.1, 1612.3 and 1612.4. Sections 104.10.1, 1612.3 and 1612.4 are amended to read:

Consideration of Flood Hazard Areas shall be as adopted by Title 15, Chapter 15.05 of this Municipal
Code

K. Section 105.1.2. Section 105.1.2 is hereby repealed in its entirety.
L. Section 105.2. Section 105.2 is amended to read as follows:

Exemptions from permit requirements of this Code shall not be deemed to grant authorization for
any work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions of this Code or any other laws
or ordinances of this jurisdiction. Permits shall not be required for the following:

1. One story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, and similar uses,
provided the floor area does not exceed one hundred twenty (120) square feet. Such structures
shall be located in accordance with Section 705.3 with respect to other structures on the same lot
and in accordance with Chapter 15.02 Zoning Regulations.



Town of Parachute, Colorado
Ordinance No. 793-2021
Exhibit A

Page 6 of 48

2. Fences not over six feet (6') high. Used for non-agricultural uses and any fence for
agricultural purposes that is a post and wire construction.

% % %k

14. Agricultural buildings as defined herein.
15. Window and door replacement provided no structural changes are needed or proposed.

16. Decks not exceeding 200 square feet (18.58 m2) in area, that are not more than 30 inches
(762 mm) above grade at any point; a site-plan is required and subject to approval with regards to
setback requirements.

17. Re-siding without alteration of wall structure provided, however, the proposed weather
barrier is not a stucco-type product*. (*If the stucco-type product will be applied over an existing
masonry or concrete surface it too shall be exempt from requiring a permit).

M. Section 105.5. Section 105.5 is amended to read as follows:

Every permit issued by the Building Official under the provisions of this code shall expire by
limitation and become null and void if the building or the work authorized by such permit is not
commenced within one hundred eighty (180) days from the date of such permit, or if the building
or work authorized by such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of one hundred eighty
(180) days at any time after the work is commenced. Permits must pass a required inspection or
show substantial progress during the one hundred eighty (180) day period in order not to be
considered suspended or abandoned. On expired permits, before such work can be commenced or
recommenced, a re-issued or new permit shall be obtained. The fee for a re-issued or new permit
shall be one-half (1/2) of the permit fee of the original permit, provided no changes have been
made or will be made in the original plans and specifications for such work, and further provided
that such suspension or abandonment has not exceeded one (1) year. Changes in plans and
specifications shall require an additional permit fee and plan review fee as described in section
r106 and section r108. Any nullified permit where the suspension or abandonments have
exceeded one (1) year will require the permittee to pay a new permit fee plus plan review fee.

Any person holding an unexpired and valid permit may apply for an extension of time to
commence work, return to work or complete work under that permit by submitting a written
request describing good and satisfactory reason for such extension. This request shall be received
prior to the date on which the original permit expires or becomes null and void. An extended
permit is valid for one hundred eighty (180) days from the date of extension, does not require



Town of Parachute, Colorado
Ordinance No. 793-2021
Exhibit A

Page 7 of 48

compliance with codes adopted since the original permit was issued, and does not require
payment of new fees. No permit shall be extended more than twice.

When a permit has expired or been nullified and a new addition of the building code has been
adopted, the original plans shall be reviewed and required to comply with the current code. The
permittee shall pay a permit fee based on the current projected valuation plus the applicable plan
check fees.

N. Section 108.3. Section 108.3 is amended to read as follows:

The State Electrical Inspector is authorized to give permission to temporarily supply and use
power in part of an electrical installation before the final certificate of completion has been
issued. The part covered by the temporary certificate shall comply with the requirements
specified for temporary lighting, heat or power as regulated by the State Electrical Inspector.

0. Section 109. Section 109 is amended to read as follows:

On buildings, structures, gas, mechanical and plumbing systems or alterations requiring a permit,
a fee for permit shall be paid as required, in accordance with the adopted Town of Parachute
building permit fee schedule as provided in PMC Appendix A.

P. Section 109.4. Section 109.4 is amended to read as follows:

Work being conducted without a valid building permit shall be subject to a fee equal to ten
percent (10%) of what a permit would cost set forth in Appendix A of this code, but not less than
$100.00 and not to exceed $500.00, and payable to the Town of Parachute if payment is received
within five (5) working days after due notice has been served. This fee will be in addition to all
applicable building permit and plan check fees. In the event that payment is not received within
the five (5) day period, the responsible party will be guilty of a Class B municipal offense, as
provided in Section 11.01.030 of the Parachute Municipal Code. Each day that a violation
continues after five (5) days from due notice being served shall be deemed a separate offense.

Q. Section 109.6. Section 109.6 is amended to read as follows:

The Building Official is authorized to establish a refund policy. The Building Official may
authorize refunding of not more than eighty percent (80%) of the permit fee paid when no work
has been done under the permit issued in accordance with this Code. The Building Official shall
not authorize refunding of any fee paid except on written application filed by the original
permittee not later than one hundred eighty (180) days after the date of fee payment.






